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PSYCHOLOGICAL INTEGRATED THERAPY:  
CLINICAL EXPERIENCE WITH A GROUP OF PATIENTS 

SCHIZOPHRENIC 

Viviana Carlotta, Nadia Barberis, Rossella Alfa,  
Maria Laura Falduto, Davide Ruvolo (1) 

(1)Department of Humanities and Social Sciences, University of Messina 

In the last few years have been positively evaluated cognitive-behavioral 
interventions on patients with schizophrenia (Lehman & Steinwachs, 2003): 
however, the limit of the success of these interventions is tied especially to 
the cognitive impairment that this disease involves. The IPT (Integrated 
Psychological Therapy) is based on the assumption that the neurocognitive 
deficits of schizophrenic patients and, in particular, the difficulty in 
processing information, have negative repercussions on social skills and 
adaptive behavior (Brenner et al., 1997). The finality of this study is to 
evaluate the efficacy of IPT in terms of improving neurocognitive functions 
and social in a group of schizophrenic patients, independently of the length 
and the chronicity of the disease. The intervention was conducted on 6 
patients aged between 25 and 55 years with a diagnosis of schizophrenia-
type residue, recruited at the Policlinico of Messina. Patients were evaluated 
through a clinical and neurocognitive semi-structured interview “Positive 
and Negative Syndrome Scale – PANSS” (Kay, Opler, & Fiszbein, 1987), 
which consists of three scales (positive, negative, psychopathological) to 
assess the primary symptoms of schizophrenia. For the evaluation of the 
level of intelligence has used the WAIS-R, referring mainly to three 
subtests: Completion of figures, Picture Arrangement, Block Design. The 
results indicate the presence of an improvement in the cognitive areas 
explored in the three subtests. These results confirm the effectiveness of IPT 
and show an improved social functioning of patients which results in a more 
adequate ability to identify a problem, in an increase of the search for 
meaningful social relations and interactions, in a better picture of itself. 



 MJCP   SUPPL. N.1B  Poster Session                                                                                      SB  !  196
QUATTROPANI & MENTO EDS. 

Acknowledgment 

We Gratefully acknowledge Ilaria Di Bella, Maria Caterina Di Perri, 
Elisabetta Grisolia, Federica Indelicato, Irene Pagano Dritto, Giovanna 
Pistorino & Amelia Rizzo for his help in revising this text. 

© 2015 by the Author(s); license Mediterranean Journal of Clinical 
Psychology,  Messina, Italy. This Suppl. is an open access, licensed under a 
Creative Commons Attribution 3.0 Unported License. Mediterranean 
Journal of Clinical Psychology, Vol. 3, No. 2, Suppl. 1 B, 2015.  

Doi: 10.6092/2282-1619/2015.1.1098 


